

MAINTENANCE OF LIBRARY FAILITIES 2024/25 FINANCIAL YEAR

Issued and Prepared by:
Winnie Madikizela Mandela Local Municipality
P.O. Box 12
Bizana
4800

Senior Manager: Community Development Services – S.L. Mtshengu

Contact Person: L. Mhlelembana

Tel: 039 2510 230

	OF CONSENT	Business Name and Address	
			
			
The Municipal Manager			
Winnie Madikizela-Mande	ela Local Municipality		
P.O. Box 12	Sia 200ai Mamopanty		
Bizana			
4800			
Sir/Madam			
_	e information herein contained shall constitute th	e basis on which my/our Bid is to be considered. I/we grant approval that any s	
regarding this Bid may be relevant to the considerate	, ,	hall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and	
relevant to the considerate	, ,	hall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and	direct
relevant to the consideral I/we (Name and Surnan to such source to provide	tion of my/our Bid. ne of Company Representative/s) confidential information.	hall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and	direct
relevant to the consideral I/we (Name and Surnan to such source to provide I/we warrant that all the in	tion of my/our Bid. ne of Company Representative/s) confidential information. nformation herein contained is to the best of my/o	hall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of grant my/our who were the same and belief true and correct in all material respects and I/we am /	direct conse
relevant to the considerate I/we (Name and Surnant to such source to provide I/we warrant that all the in aware of any information	tion of my/our Bid. ne of Company Representative/s) confidential information. nformation herein contained is to the best of my/o which, should it become known to the Winnie Ma	chall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of grant my/our of the work was and belief true and correct in all material respects and I/we am //adikizela-Mandela Local Municipality, would affect the consideration of my/our I	direct conse are no Bid in
relevant to the considerate I/we (Name and Surnan to such source to provide I/we warrant that all the ir aware of any information any way. The Winnie Mar	tion of my/our Bid. ne of Company Representative/s) confidential information. nformation herein contained is to the best of my/o which, should it become known to the Winnie Ma	hall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of grant my/our who were the same and belief true and correct in all material respects and I/we am /	direct conse are no Bid in
relevant to the considerate I/we (Name and Surnanto such source to provide I/we warrant that all the inaware of any information any way. The Winnie Macconfidential.	tion of my/our Bid. ne of Company Representative/s) confidential information. nformation herein contained is to the best of my/o which, should it become known to the Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality wishes to info	chall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of grant my/our of the work was and belief true and correct in all material respects and I/we am //adikizela-Mandela Local Municipality, would affect the consideration of my/our I	direct conse are no Bid in
relevant to the considerate I/we (Name and Surnan to such source to provide I/we warrant that all the ir aware of any information any way. The Winnie Mar	tion of my/our Bid. ne of Company Representative/s) confidential information. nformation herein contained is to the best of my/o which, should it become known to the Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality wishes to information.	chall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of grant my/our of the work was and belief true and correct in all material respects and I/we am //adikizela-Mandela Local Municipality, would affect the consideration of my/our I	direct conse are no Bid in
relevant to the considerate I/we (Name and Surnanto such source to provide I/we warrant that all the inaware of any information any way. The Winnie Macconfidential.	tion of my/our Bid. ne of Company Representative/s) confidential information. nformation herein contained is to the best of my/o which, should it become known to the Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality wishes to info	chall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of grant my/our of the work was and belief true and correct in all material respects and I/we am //adikizela-Mandela Local Municipality, would affect the consideration of my/our I	direct conse are no Bid in
relevant to the considerate I/we (Name and Surnanto such source to provide I/we warrant that all the inaware of any information any way. The Winnie Macconfidential.	tion of my/our Bid. ne of Company Representative/s) confidential information. nformation herein contained is to the best of my/o which, should it become known to the Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality wishes to information.	chall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of grant my/our of the work was and belief true and correct in all material respects and I/we am //adikizela-Mandela Local Municipality, would affect the consideration of my/our I	direct conse are no Bid in
relevant to the considerate I/we (Name and Surnanto such source to provide I/we warrant that all the inaware of any information any way. The Winnie Macconfidential.	tion of my/our Bid. ne of Company Representative/s) confidential information. nformation herein contained is to the best of my/o which, should it become known to the Winnie Ma dikizela-Mandela Local Municipality wishes to information. I/We hereby consent to the above	chall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of grant my/our of the work was and belief true and correct in all material respects and I/we am //adikizela-Mandela Local Municipality, would affect the consideration of my/our I	direct conse are no Bid in
relevant to the considerate I/we (Name and Surnanto such source to provide I/we warrant that all the inaware of any information any way. The Winnie Macconfidential.	tion of my/our Bid. ne of Company Representative/s) confidential information. nformation herein contained is to the best of my/o which, should it become known to the Winnie Ma dikizela-Mandela Local Municipality wishes to information. I/We hereby consent to the above	thall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of	direct conse are no Bid in
relevant to the considerate I/we (Name and Surnanto such source to provide I/we warrant that all the inaware of any information any way. The Winnie Macconfidential.	ition of my/our Bid. The of Company Representative/s) The confidential information. The confidential information is to the best of my/out which, should it become known to the Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality wishes to information. I/We hereby consent to the above	thall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of	direct conse are no Bid in
relevant to the considerate I/we (Name and Surnanto such source to provide I/we warrant that all the inaware of any information any way. The Winnie Macconfidential.	ition of my/our Bid. The of Company Representative/s) The confidential information. The confidential information is to the best of my/out which, should it become known to the Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality wishes to information. I/We hereby consent to the above	thall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of	direct conse are no Bid in
relevant to the considerate I/we (Name and Surnanto such source to provide I/we warrant that all the inaware of any information any way. The Winnie Macconfidential.	ition of my/our Bid. The of Company Representative/s) The confidential information. The confidential information is to the best of my/out which, should it become known to the Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality wishes to information. I/We hereby consent to the above	thall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of	direct conse are no Bid in
relevant to the considerar I/we (Name and Surnan to such source to provide I/we warrant that all the in aware of any information any way. The Winnie Mac confidential. Please tick the appro	ition of my/our Bid. ne of Company Representative/s) confidential information. Information herein contained is to the best of my/o which, should it become known to the Winnie Ma dikizela-Mandela Local Municipality wishes to info priate box. I/We hereby consent to the above I/We hereby withhold consent and fully unders: Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality	thall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of	direct conse are no Bid in
relevant to the considerar I/we (Name and Surnan to such source to provide I/we warrant that all the in aware of any information any way. The Winnie Mac confidential. Please tick the appro	ition of my/our Bid. The of Company Representative/s) The confidential information. The confidential information is to the best of my/out which, should it become known to the Winnie Midikizela-Mandela Local Municipality wishes to information. I/We hereby consent to the above I/We hereby withhold consent and fully undersome with the winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality.	thall be of material value to Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality and grant my/our of	direct conse are no Bid in



WINNIE MADIKIZELA MANDELA LOCAL MUNICIPALITY ADVERT

PROJECT NAME	CONTRACT NUMBER	MINIMUM CIDB REQUIREMENT	CLOSING DATE
Maintenance of Library Facilities	WMM-LM 22/01/25/09 MLF	1 GB	13 February 2025 @ 12h00

Bid are hereby invited from suitably qualified and accredited service providers who are interested to submit their tender responses for the above-mentioned projects for Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality.

Bid documents are available to be downloaded from e-tender portal website on www.etenders.gov.za

Bids should score a minimum point of 70% on the functionality evaluation in order to be considered for further evaluation.

The bids will be evaluated on the 80/20 or 90/10 preferential points system

Failure to submit the following document(s) completed in full will render the bid not responsive:

- A completed original document issued by the municipality
- A copy of Entity Registration Documents, Certified ID Copy(ies) of Director(s) (not older than 3 months), proof of CSD Registration
- SARS Valid PIN Printout
- Bid documents MBD1, MBD4, MBD6.1, MBD 6.2, MBD 6.4, MBD 8 and MDB 9
- Billing Clearance Certificate or Statement of Municipal Accounts confirming that no undisputed municipal accounts are
 overdue by more than 30 days and a signed letter by the bidder confirming that the entity does not have outstanding
 accounts more than 30 Days on the day of the tender closing.
- Evaluation Criteria: 80 or 90= Price, 20 or 10= Specific Goals as per the attached MBD 6.1 respectively
- In case of a joint venture, an original valid Tax Compliance Document of all partners should be submitted as well as a signed agreement by both parties clearly indicating the lead partner
- The Minimum Threshold for Local Content for the above-mentioned projects is 100%

Advert Date: 24/01/2025

Publication: Local/Provincial Newspaper, Municipal Website, e-tender portal.

Closing Date: All tenders must be emailed to tenders.scm@mbizana.gov.za by no later than the date and time stated above after which they will be opened.

The municipality will only consider bids submitted on the original bid documentation provided by the municipality. All tenders must be clearly marked the Name of the project and Reference number indicated above. Failure to do so your tender may not be considered. Any unauthorized alterations in BOQ/Quotation to the tender document shall render the submission invalid.

No late, hand delivered, incomplete or facsimile bids will be accepted for consideration. The only or lowest bid received shall not necessarily be accepted. Winnie Madikizela-Mandela Local Municipality reserves the right to accept part of or the full bid. For technical enquiries, please contact Ms. L. Mhlelembana on 071 465 8402, email: mhlelembanal@mbizana.gov.za during working hours. For Supply Chain Management related enquiries, please contact Mr. Z. Khala on (079) 886 0942, email: khalaz@mbizana.gov.za during working hours

Maintenance of Library Facilities

Mr. L. Mahlaka Municipal Manager

MBD 1

YOU ARE HEREBY INVITED TO BID FOR REQUIREMENTS OF THE (NAME OF MUNICIPALITY/ MUNICIPAL ENTITY)							
BID NUMBER:	CLOSING DATE: CLOSING TIME:						
DESCRIPTION							
THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER WILL BE REQU			GN A WI	RITTEN	CONTRACT FO	RM (N	MBD7).
BID RESPONSE DOCUMENTS MAY BE SE		-					
EMAIL ADDRESS PROVIDED BELOW	OR AS PER	TENDER					
REQUIREMENTS							
TENDERS.SCM@MBIZANA.GOV.ZA for tel	TENDERS.SCM@MBIZANA.GOV.ZA for tenders above R300 000 inclusive of VAT						
OR	OR Control of the con						
QUOTES.SCM@MBIZANA.GOV.ZA for quo	tations below F	R300 000 bi	ut above	R30 00	0 inclusive of V	ΆΤ	
SUPPLIER INFORMATION							
NAME OF BIDDER							
POSTAL ADDRESS							
STREET ADDRESS					T	1	
TELEPHONE NUMBER	CODE				NUMBER		
CELLPHONE NUMBER	0005				Luuree	1	
FACSIMILE NUMBER	CODE				NUMBER		
E-MAIL ADDRESS							
VAT REGISTRATION NUMBER	TOO DIN			00	00D N		
TAX COMPLIANCE STATUS	TCS PIN:			OR	CSD No:		
PEOPLE LIVING WITH DISABILITY	☐ Yes			MILITA	NDV		/oo
[TICK APPLICABLE BOX]	l les			VETE		Ш '	165
[HORALI EIGABLE BOX]	□No			V L I L I	VIII		No
[DOCUMENTARY PROOF/ SWORN A		OR PEOP	LE LIV	ING W	ITH DISABILI		
ORDER TO QUALIFY FOR PREFERENCE							
				ARE	YOU A		
ARE YOU THE ACCREDITED					EIGN BASEL)	
REPRESENTATIVE IN SOUTH					PLIER FOR T		
AFRICA FOR THE GOODS	□Yes		□No		DDS /SERVIC		☐Yes ☐No
/SERVICES /WORKS OFFERED?	[IF YES ENC	LOSE PRO	OF]	////	RKS OFFERE	-D?	[IF YES, ANSWER PART B:3]
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS							
OFFERED				TOT	AL BID PRICE	_	R
OTTENED				101	AL DID I NICE	_	K
SIGNATURE OF BIDDER							
SIGNATURE OF BIDDER				DAT	Έ		
CAPACITY UNDER WHICH THIS							
BID IS SIGNED BIDDING PROCEDURE ENQUIRIES MAY BE DIRECTED TO: TECHNICAL INFORMATION MAY BE DIRECTED TO:							
BIDDING PROCEDURE ENQUIRIES MAY B	E DIRECTED TO	U:				IAYB	E DIRECTED TO:
DEPARTMENT				ACT PER		_	
CONTACT PERSON					NUMBER		
TELEPHONE NUMBER	FACSIMILE NUMBER E-MAIL ADDRESS						
FACSIMILE NUMBER	1		E-MAIL	. AUURI	-88		
E-MAIL ADDRESS							

TERMS AND CONDITIONS FOR BIDDING

1. 1.1.	BIDS MUST BE DELIVERED BY THE STIPULATED TIME TO THE FOR CONSIDERATION.	CORRECT ADDRESS. LATE BIDS W	ILL NOT BE ACCEPTED		
1.2.	ALL BIDS MUST BE SUBMITTED ON THE OFFICIAL FORMS PROVIDED-(NOT TO BE RE-TYPED) OR ONLINE				
1.3.	. THIS BID IS SUBJECT TO THE PREFERENTIAL PROCUREMENT POLICY FRAMEWORK ACT AND THE PREFERENTIAL PROCUREMENT REGULATIONS, 2017, THE GENERAL CONDITIONS OF CONTRACT (GCC) AND, IF APPLICABLE, ANY OTHER SPECIAL CONDITIONS OF CONTRACT.				
2.	TAX COMPLIANCE REQUIREMENTS				
2.1	BIDDERS MUST ENSURE COMPLIANCE WITH THEIR TAX OBLIGA	TIONS.			
2.2	BIDDERS ARE REQUIRED TO SUBMIT THEIR UNIQUE PERSON ENABLE THE ORGAN OF STATE TO VIEW THE TAXPAYER'S PRO) ISSUED BY SARS TO		
2.3	APPLICATION FOR THE TAX COMPLIANCE STATUS (TCS) CERTIFICATE OR PIN MAY ALSO BE MADE VIA E-FILING. IN ORDER TO USE THIS PROVISION, TAXPAYERS WILL NEED TO REGISTER WITH SARS AS E-FILERS THROUGH THE WEBSITE WWW.SARS.GOV.ZA.				
2.4	FOREIGN SUPPLIERS MUST COMPLETE THE PRE-AWARD QUES	TIONNAIRE IN PART B:3.			
2.5	BIDDERS MAY ALSO SUBMIT A PRINTED TCS CERTIFICATE TOG	ETHER WITH THE BID.			
2.6	IN BIDS WHERE CONSORTIA / JOINT VENTURES / SUB-CONTRACTORS ARE INVOLVED, EACH PARTY MUST SUBMIT A SEPARATE TCS CERTIFICATE / PIN / CSD NUMBER.				
2.7	WHERE NO TCS IS AVAILABLE BUT THE BIDDER IS REGISTER NUMBER MUST BE PROVIDED.	ED ON THE CENTRAL SUPPLIER D	ATABASE (CSD), A CSD		
3.	QUESTIONNAIRE TO BIDDING FOREIGN SUPPLIERS				
3.1.	IS THE ENTITY A RESIDENT OF THE REPUBLIC OF SOUTH AFRIC	A (RSA)?	ES NO		
3.2.	DOES THE ENTITY HAVE A BRANCH IN THE RSA?		ES 🗌 NO		
3.3.	DOES THE ENTITY HAVE A PERMANENT ESTABLISHMENT IN TH	ERSA?	ES NO		
3.4.	DOES THE ENTITY HAVE ANY SOURCE OF INCOME IN THE RSA?		ES NO		
3.5.	IS THE ENTITY LIABLE IN THE RSA FOR ANY FORM OF TAXATION	I?	ES 🗌 NO		
IF TI STA	HE ANSWER IS "NO" TO ALL OF THE ABOVE, THEN IT IS NOT A TUS SYSTEM PIN CODE FROM THE SOUTH AFRICAN REVENUE S	A REQUIREMENT TO REGISTER FO ERVICE (SARS) AND IF NOT REGIST	OR A TAX COMPLIANCE FER AS PER 2.3 ABOVE.		
	NB: FAILURE TO PROVIDE ANY OF THE ABOVE PARTICULA NO BIDS WILL BE CONSIDERED FROM PERSONS IN THE SE				
	SIGNATURE OF BIDDER:				
	CAPACITY UNDER WHICH THIS BID IS SIGNED:				
	DATE:				

2. BACKGROUND AND OVERVIEW OF THE PROJECT

1.1 INTRODUCTION

Winnie Madikizela Mandela LM (WMMLM) Libraries needs maintenance as is crucial to ensure the longevity and functionality of the library's physical space, collections, and technology. Regular maintenance: Preserves the library's physical infrastructure. Protects collections from damage and deterioration. Ensure technology and equipment functionality. Provides a safe and healthy environment for users. Supports efficient library operations.

WMMLM is home to the following Libraries:

- Mbizana Main Library–Bizana Town Ward 1
- Ebenezer Community Library–Ebenezer Village Ward 24
- Nkantolo Community Library–Nkantolo Village Ward 27
- Monwabisi Mfingwana Community Library–Dudumeni Village Ward 8

Social & Indigent Support Services under Community Services Department facilitate maintenance of libraries around Winnie Madikizela-Mandela LM jurisdiction. These libraries need maintenance and equipping as they are mainly used by our communities more often as part of promoting and instilling a culture of reading. This serves to request maintenance from time to time.

1.2 OVERALL AND SPECIFIC OBJECTIVES OF THE PROJECT

2.2.1 Overall objective

Social & Indigent Support Services under Community Services Department facilitate maintenance of libraries. Library maintenance ensures a safe, functional, and supportive environment for users, staff, and collections. This serves to request maintenance of libraries.

2.2.2 Specific Objectives

Specific objectives of this project include but are not limited to enhancing the following:

• Physical Maintenance

Ensure clean and safe environment for users and staff. Maintain library building, furniture and equipment. Ensure accessibility and compliance with disability standards.

Collection Maintenance

Preserve and conserve library materials.

• Technology Maintenance

Ensure reliable and efficient IT infrastructure.

• Safety and Security

Secure library premises and materials. Ensure user and staff safety. Prevent theft, vandalism, or misuse.

• Compliance and Regulatory

Meet local, national, and international standards. Adhere to health and safety regulations.

3. SCOPE & EXTENT OF WORK

The scope of work required for the contract includes the following:

LIST OF ITEMS, DESCRIPTIONS AND QUANTITIES

PRICING SCHEDULE

Mbizana Public Library

Item No.	Description	Qty	Price	Total
Roll up blind	Installation of roll-up blinds for	1		
	storeroom door in Main Library -			
	Standard door 2032 x 813			
Cleansing of	Deep cleansing of floor rugs (4m x	Briefing		
floor rug &	2m and 3m x 2m) and high-pressure	Session		
windows	windows cleansing at Main Library			
Door Locks	Change door locks at storeroom in	2		
	Main Library			
Electrical	Electrical plugs produce spark needs	3		
plugs	to be attended and corrected test			
	results required in Main Library			
Aluminum	Replacing & installation of aluminum	1		
Door	library door			
Mat	Supply and delivery Microfiber	1		
	doormat washable Black color (0.9x			
	1.5 m) in Main Library			
Aluminum	Repair of Aluminum windows around	6		
windows	the Library (securing of glass to			
repair	aluminum frame)			
Extension	Extension cord 50m and multiplug	2		
cord with	with surge protector			
surge				
PVC vinyl	PVC Vinyl Carpet Runner Protector,	20m		
carpet	70cm wide and sold per meter,			
runner	designed to prevent everyday wear			
protector	and tear			

Laminating	Laminating pouches: A4 200pcs
pouches	150-micron x1
and barcode	Barcode scanner wired USB for
scanner	library cards x1

NB: There will be a compulsory briefing session at the Main Library at 09h00.

Nkantolo Public Library

Item No.	Description	Qty	Price	Total
Stainless	Stainless steel brackets	50		
steel	mounted and fixed to park-			
brackets	home library in Nkantolo			
	village, Pre-drilled for ease of			
	installation			
Thickly	18mm Thick ply wood floor	40m²		
wood floor	base mounted to cross			
base	members of the bottom edges			
	of the base floors (Installation)			
Vinyl	Supply and fit vinyl flooring for	50m²		
flooring	library floors match the existing			
Arch weld	Arch weld rotten loose cross	Provisional		
rotten cross	members			
members				
Concrete	Supply and fix broken parts of	2m³		
apron	concrete apron covering			
covering	electric conduits			
electric				
conduits				
Extension	Extension cord 50m and	2		
cord with	multiplug with surge protector			

surge			
Laminating	Laminating pouches:		
pouches	A4 200pcs 150 micron x1		
with	Barcode scanner wired USB for		
barcode	library cards x1		
scanner			

NB: Site briefing will be conducted in Nkantolo Public Library at 12h00.

Ebenezer Public Library

Item No.	Description	Qty	Price	Total
Roll up	Supply and install Roll up	1		
blind	Blinds for main door which is			
	double size door.			
Extension	Extension cord with surge	2		
cord with	(50M) and Multi-plug with			
surge	surge protector			
Library	Logo 1: Welcome to Ebenezer	2		
signage	Public Library with Wild Coast			
	Sun logo, WMMLM logo and			
	Department of Sport, Recreation,			
	Arts & Culture (design to be			
	discussed with appointed service			
	provider)			
	To be mounted on the library wall			
	Fabricated aluminum letters for			
	each individual letter with			
	Perspex front and logo fabricated			
	in same aluminum			
	"WELCOME TO "is laser cut			

individual Perspex letters in	
black.	
346 x 625 measurements	
Light Box aluminum sign	
section mounted on galvanized	
steel poles faces to be made	
from Perspex close to the gate	
1810 x 2300 measurements	
Logo 2: Wild Coast Sun,	
WMMLM logo, DSRAC Logo	
Ebenezer Public Library	
Contact no: 087 106 6172 / 087	
288 1857	
Website: www.mbizana.gov.za	
Working Hours	
Monday - Thursday (08:00-	
16:30) Friday (08:00-15:30)	
Closed on Saturdays, Sundays	
and Public Holidays	

Monwabisi Mfingwana Public Library

Item No.	Description	Qty	Price	Total
Electrical	Maintenance of Electrical	10		
plugs	plugs in the library that are			
	not working			
Extension	Supply of 8-way Multi-Plug	1		
cord with	with surge protector and			
surge.	extension cord.			
8way				
multi plug				

SUB-TOTAL	
VAT @ 15%	
GRAND TOTAL	

4. PROJECT TIME FRAME

The project time frame will be 3 months from the date of appointment.

5. KEY OUTPUTS/PROJECT MILESTONES/DELIVERABLES

Maintenance of 4 libraries

6. REPORTING MECHANISM

The project duration is 3 months for maintenance of 4 libraries. The Project Manager **Ms N Mqeke** will be available for any queries on 039 251 0230.

PROOF OF ATTENDANCE TO A BRIEFING / SITE INSPECTION MEETING

NB: This is to be completed at the site or briefing meeting. Failure to have your document signed will result in disqualification of your bid.

Bidders Representative Details

FullName/s:	.Surname:
Name of Bidder:	
WMMLM Representative	
Full Name:	
Signature	
Date: Time:	

IMPORTANT NOTICE

By applying for this bid, you hereby acknowledge that you have read and accept the following Protection of Personal Information ACT (POPIA) disclaimer:

I hereby consent for WMMLM to process my personal information as part of the procurement process. WMMLM shall take all reasonable measures to protect the personal information of applicants and for the purpose of this disclaimer "personal information" shall be defined as detailed in the Protection of Personal Information Act, Act 4 of 2013 ("POPIA").

7. EVALUATION CRITERIA

Evaluation criteria of the bid;

The bids will be evaluated in two stages, namely:

- Stage 1- Functionality
- Stage 2- Price and Specific Goals

Only Bidders who score 70 or more on stage 1 would be evaluated further and therefore eligible

ITEM	Weight
STAGE 1 OF EVALUATION – FUNCTIONALITY	100
Previous Experience	50
Capacity, Expertise and Methodology	50
STAGE 2 OF EVALUATION – PRICE & PREFERENTIAL POINTS	100
Specific Goals	20
Price	80

for the award.

Previous Company Experience	Weight
Note: The scoring in this section is not cumulative	
Traceable records of 3 (three) maintenance of public or private	50
facilities to the value of R300 000.00 each, to the Public or Private	
Sector	
Traceable records of 2 (two) maintenance of public or private	30
facilities to the value of R300 000.00 each, to the Public or Private	
Sector	
Traceable records of 1 (one) maintenance of public or private	20
facilities to the value of R300 000.00 each, to the Public or Private	
Sector	
Maximum Weighting	50
Note COMPULSORY attachments for verifying work done:	
a traceable record will be evaluated on the basis of:	

- A bidder must attach a valid appointment / official purchase order and reference letter that is not more than 3 Months old for each project completed.

Project Management	Weight
	50
Project Foreman / Project Manager Maximum Weighting	20
A project Manager with:	
Diploma or Degree in Civil Engineering	
Minimum of 5 years in Project Management of Building / Building Maintenance Projects	
Resources to execute the work – maximum weight	30
The Service provider must specify & provide proof of at least a delivery bakkie in the following manner:	10
Ownership mode of transport	
Attach certificate of registration as proof of ownership.	
<u>OR</u>	
☐ Hired mode of transport.	
Attach certified copy of lease agreement as proof.	
Methodology	20
Methodology must include the following:	
Clear Execution Plan	
> Labour Component	
Time frames	
Total Maximum Weighting	100

8. SUBMISSION OF BIDS

Proposals must be emailed to tenders.scm@mbizana.gov.za by no later than the closing date as specified on the advert: "MAINTENANCE OF LIBRARY FACILITIES"

For any queries regarding this tender, please contact Mrs L. Mhlelembana for project related queries; on 071 465 8402 or; Supply Chain Management contact for SCM related queries at telephone number 039-2510 230 Mr. Z. Khala during office hours.

MBD 4

DECLARATION OF INTEREST

- 1. No bid will be accepted from persons in the service of the state¹.
- 2. Any person, having a kinship with persons in the service of the state, including a blood relationship, may make an offer or offers in terms of this invitation to bid. In view of possible allegations of favouritism, should the resulting bid, or part thereof, be awarded to persons connected with or related to persons in service of the state, it is required that the bidder or their authorised representative declare their position in relation to the evaluating/adjudicating authority.

	order to give effect to the above, the following questionnaire must be completed and itted with the bid.
3.1	Full Name of bidder or his or her representative:
3.2	Identity Number:
3.3	Position occupied in the Company (director, trustee, hareholder²):
3.4	Company Registration Number:
3.5	Tax Reference Number:
3.6	VAT Registration Number:
3.7	The names of all directors / trustees / shareholders members, their individual identity numbers and state employee numbers must be indicated in paragraph 4 below.
3.8	Are you presently in the service of the state? YES / NO
	3.8.1 If yes, furnish particulars.
(c) an (d) an cor No.	nember of the board of directors of any municipal entity; official of any municipality or municipal entity; employee of any national or provincial department, national or provincial public entity or estitutional institution within the meaning of the Public Finance Management Act, 1999 (Ac of 1999); hember of the accounting authority of any national or provincial public entity; or

² Shareholder" means a person who owns shares in the company and is actively involved in the

Have you been in the service of the state for the past twelve months?YES / NO

3.9.1 If yes, furnish particulars.....

management of the company or business and exercises control over the company.

3.9

3.10	Do you have any relationship (family, friend, other) with persons in the service of the state and who may be involved with the evaluation and or adjudication of this bid?
	3.10.1 If yes, furnish particulars.
3.11	Are you, aware of any relationship (family, friend, other) between any other bidder and any persons in the service of the state who may be involved with the evaluation and or adjudication of this bid? YES / NO
	3.11.1 If yes, furnish particulars
3.12	Are any of the company's directors, trustees, managers, principle shareholders or stakeholders in service of the state? YES / NO
	3.12.1 If yes, furnish particulars.
3.13	Are any spouse, child or parent of the company's directors trustees, managers, principle shareholders or stakeholders
YES / NO	in service of the state?
	3.13.1 If yes, furnish particulars.
3.14	Do you or any of the directors, trustees, managers, principle shareholders, or stakeholders of this company have any interest in any other related companies or business whether or not they are bidding for this contract.
YES / NO	
	3.14.1 If yes, furnish particulars:

(G) 4. FULL DETAILS OF DIRECTORS / TRUSTEES / MEMBERS / SHAREHOLDERS.

Full Name	Identity Number	State Employee Number

CERTIFICATION	
I, THE UNDERSIGNED (FULL NAMES)	
CERTIFY THAT THE INFORMATION FUI FORM IS CORRECT. I ACCEPT THAT THE MUNICIPALITY MA	
DECLARATION PROVE TO BE FALSE.	
(H)	
Signature	Date
Capacity	Name of Bidder
110000	

MBD 6.1

PREFERENCE POINTS CLAIM FORM IN TERMS OF THE PREFERENTIAL PROCUREMENT REGULATIONS 2022

This preference form must form part of all tenders invited. It contains general information and serves as a claim form for preference points for specific goals.

NB: BEFORE COMPLETING THIS FORM, TENDERERS MUST STUDY THE GENERAL CONDITIONS, DEFINITIONS AND DIRECTIVES APPLICABLE IN RESPECT OF THE TENDER AND PREFERENTIAL PROCUREMENT REGULATIONS. 2022

1. GENERAL CONDITIONS

- 1.1 The following preference point systems are applicable to invitations to tender:
 - the 80/20 system for requirements with a Rand value of up to R50 000 000 (all applicable taxes included); and
 - the 90/10 system for requirements with a Rand value above R50 000 000 (all applicable taxes included).
- 1.2 To be completed by the organ of state

(delete whichever is not applicable for this tender).

- a) The applicable preference point system for this tender is the 90/10 preference point system.
- b) The applicable preference point system for this tender is the 80/20 preference point system.
- c) Either the 90/10 or 80/20 preference point system will be applicable in this tender. The lowest/ highest acceptable tender will be used to determine the accurate system once tenders are received.
- 1.3 Points for this tender (even in the case of a tender for income-generating contracts) shall be awarded for:
 - (a) Price; and
 - (b) Specific Goals.

1.4 To be completed by the organ of state:

The maximum points for this tender are allocated as follows:

	POINTS
PRICE	
SPECIFIC GOALS	
Total points for Price and SPECIFIC GOALS	100

- 1.5 Failure on the part of a tenderer to submit proof or documentation required in terms of this tender to claim points for specific goals with the tender, will be interpreted to mean that preference points for specific goals are not claimed.
- 1.6 The organ of state reserves the right to require of a tenderer, either before a tender is adjudicated or at any time subsequently, to substantiate any claim in regard to preferences, in any manner required by the organ of state.

2. **DEFINITIONS**

- (a)
 - "tender" means a written offer in the form determined by an organ of state in response to an invitation to provide goods or services through price quotations, competitive tendering process or any other method envisaged in legislation;
- (b) "price" means an amount of money tendered for goods or services, and includes all applicable taxes less all unconditional discounts;
- (c) "rand value" means the total estimated value of a contract in Rand, calculated at the time of bid invitation, and includes all applicable taxes;
- (d) "tender for income-generating contracts" means a written offer in the form determined by an organ of state in response to an invitation for the origination of income-generating contracts through any method envisaged in legislation that will result in a legal agreement between the organ of state and a third party that produces revenue for the organ of state, and includes, but is not limited to, leasing and disposal of assets and concession contracts, excluding direct sales and disposal of assets through public auctions; and
- (e) "the Act" means the Preferential Procurement Policy Framework Act, 2000 (Act No. 5 of 2000).

3. FORMULAE FOR PROCUREMENT OF GOODS AND SERVICES

3.1. **POINTS AWARDED FOR PRICE**

3.1.1 THE 80/20 OR 90/10 PREFERENCE POINT SYSTEMS

A maximum of 80 or 90 points is allocated for price on the following basis:

$$Ps = 80\left(1-rac{Pt-P\,min}{P\,min}
ight)$$
 or $Ps = 90\left(1-rac{Pt-P\,min}{P\,min}
ight)$ Where

Ps = Points scored for price of tender under consideration

Pt = Price of tender under consideration

3.2. FORMULAE FOR DISPOSAL OR LEASING OF STATE ASSETS AND INCOME GENERATING PROCUREMENT

3.2.1. POINTS AWARDED FOR PRICE

A maximum of 80 or 90 points is allocated for price on the following basis:

$$80/20$$
 or $90/10$ $Ps = 80\left(1 + \frac{Pt - P max}{P max}\right)$ or $Ps = 90\left(1 + \frac{Pt - P max}{P max}\right)$

Where

Ps = Points scored for price of tender under consideration

Pt = Price of tender under consideration

Pmax = Price of highest acceptable tender

4. POINTS AWARDED FOR SPECIFIC GOALS

- 4.1. In terms of Regulation 4(2); 5(2); 6(2) and 7(2) of the Preferential Procurement Regulations, preference points must be awarded for specific goals stated in the tender. For the purposes of this tender the tenderer will be allocated points based on the goals stated in table 1 below as may be supported by proof/ documentation stated in the conditions of this tender:
- 4.2. In cases where organs of state intend to use Regulation 3(2) of the Regulations, which states that, if it is unclear whether the 80/20 or 90/10 preference point system applies, an organ of state must, in the tender documents, stipulate in the case of—
 - (a) an invitation for tender for income-generating contracts, that either the 80/20 or 90/10 preference point system will apply and that the highest acceptable tender will be used to determine the applicable preference point system; or
 - (b) any other invitation for tender, that either the 80/20 or 90/10 preference point system will apply and that the lowest acceptable tender will be used to determine the applicable preference point system,

then the organ of state must indicate the points allocated for specific goals for both the 90/10 and 80/20 preference point system.

Table 1: Specific goals for the tender and points claimed are indicated per the table below.

(Note to organs of state: Where either the 90/10 or 80/20 preference point system is applicable, corresponding points must also be indicated as such.

Note to tenderers: The tenderer must indicate how they claim points for each preference point system.)

The specific goals allocated points in terms of this tender	Number of points allocated (90/10 system) (To be completed by the organ of state)	Number of points allocated (80/20 system) (To be completed by the organ of state)	Number of points claimed (90/10 system) (To be completed by the tenderer)	Number of points claimed (80/20 system) (To be completed by the tenderer)
South African	1.5	3		
Black	1.5	3		
Women	1.75	3.5		
Youth	1.75	3.5		
Leaving with disability	1.75	3.5		
Military Veterans	1.75	3.5		
Total Points Allocated	10	20		

DECLARATION WITH REGARD TO COMPANY/FIRM

4.3.	Name company/firm		of
4.4.	Company	registration	number:
4.5.	•	nt Venture / Consortium siness/sole propriety on	

	(Pty) Limited
	Non-Profit Company
	State Owned Company
Tic	CK APPLICABLE BOX

- 4.6. I, the undersigned, who is duly authorised to do so on behalf of the company/firm, certify that the points claimed, based on the specific goals as advised in the tender, qualifies the company/ firm for the preference(s) shown and I acknowledge that:
 - i) The information furnished is true and correct;
 - ii) The preference points claimed are in accordance with the General Conditions as indicated in paragraph 1 of this form;
 - iii) In the event of a contract being awarded as a result of points claimed as shown in paragraphs 1.4 and 4.2, the contractor may be required to furnish documentary proof to the satisfaction of the organ of state that the claims are correct:
 - iv) If the specific goals have been claimed or obtained on a fraudulent basis or any of the conditions of contract have not been fulfilled, the organ of state may, in addition to any other remedy it may have
 - (a) disqualify the person from the tendering process;
 - (b) recover costs, losses or damages it has incurred or suffered as a result of that person's conduct;
 - (c) cancel the contract and claim any damages which it has suffered as a result of having to make less favourable arrangements due to such cancellation;
 - (d) recommend that the tenderer or contractor, its shareholders and directors, or only the shareholders and directors who acted on a fraudulent basis, be restricted from obtaining business from any organ of state for a period not exceeding 10 years, after the audi alteram partem (hear the other side) rule has been applied; and
 - (e) forward the matter for criminal prosecution, if deemed necessary.

	SIGNATURE(S) OF TENDERER(S)			
	SURNAME AND NAME:			
	DATE:			
	ADDRESS:			
I				
-				

(I) DECLARATION OF BIDDER'S PAST SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT PRACTICES

- 1 This Municipal Bidding Document must form part of all bids invited.
- It serves as a declaration to be used by municipalities and municipal entities in ensuring that when goods and services are being procured, all reasonable steps are taken to combat the abuse of the supply chain management system.
- The bid of any bidder may be rejected if that bidder, or any of its directors have:
 - a. abused the municipality's / municipal entity's supply chain management system or committed any improper conduct in relation to such system;
 - b. been convicted for fraud or corruption during the past five years;
 - c. willfully neglected, reneged on or failed to comply with any government, municipal or other public sector contract during the past five years; or
 - d. been listed in the Register for Tender Defaulters in terms of section 29 of the Prevention and Combating of Corrupt Activities Act (No 12 of 2004).
- In order to give effect to the above, the following questionnaire must be completed and submitted with the bid.

Item	Question	Yes	No
4.1	Is the bidder or any of its directors listed on the National Treasury's Database of Restricted Suppliers as companies or persons prohibited from doing business with the public sector?	Yes	No
	(Companies or persons who are listed on this Database were informed in		
	writing of this restriction by the Accounting Officer/Authority of the		
	institution that imposed the restriction after the audi alteram partem rule was		
	applied).		
	The Database of Restricted Suppliers now resides on the National		
	Treasury's website(<u>www.treasury.gov.za</u>) and can be accessed by clicking		
	on its link at the bottom of the home page.		

4.1.1	If so, furnish particulars:			
4.2	Is the bidder or any of its directors listed on the Register for Tender Defaulters in terms of section 29 of the Prevention and Combating of Corrupt Activities Act (No 12 of 2004)? The Register for Tender Defaulters can be accessed on the National Treasury's website (www.treasury.gov.za) by clicking on its link at the bottom of the home page.		Yes	No 🗀
4.2.1	If so, furnish particulars:			
4.3	Was the bidder or any of its directors convicted by a court outside the Republic of South Africa) for fraud or corruption		Yes	No
4.3.1	If so, furnish particulars:			
Item	Question		Yes	No
4.4	Does the bidder or any of its directors owe any municipal to the municipality / municipal entity, or to any other munarrears for more than three months?		Yes	No
4.4.1	If so, furnish particulars:			
4.5	.5 Was any contract between the bidder and the municipality / municipal entity or any other organ of state terminated during the past five years on account of failure to perform on or comply with the contract?		Yes	No
4.7.1	4.7.1 If so, furnish particulars:			
	CERTIFICA I, THE UNDERSIGNED (FULL NAMES) CERTIFY THAT THE INFORMATION FURNISH DECLARATION FORM TRUE AND CORRECT.			
	I ACCEPT THAT, IN ADDITION TO CANCELLA TAKEN AGAINST ME SHOULD THIS DECLAR.		MAY BE	
	Signature	Date		
	Position	Name of Bidder		

CERTIFICATE OF INDEPENDENT BID DETERMINATION

- 1 This Municipal Bidding Document (MBD) must form part of all bids¹ invited.
- Section 4 (1) (b) (iii) of the Competition Act No. 89 of 1998, as amended, prohibits an agreement between, or concerted practice by, firms, or a decision by an association of firms, if it is between parties in a horizontal relationship and if it involves collusive bidding (or bid rigging).² Collusive bidding is a *pe se* prohibition meaning that it cannot be justified under any grounds.
- Municipal Supply Regulation 38 (1) prescribes that a supply chain management policy must provide measures for the combating of abuse of the supply chain management system, and must enable the accounting officer, among others, to:
 - a. take all reasonable steps to prevent such abuse;
 - b. reject the bid of any bidder if that bidder or any of its directors has abused the supply chain management system of the municipality or municipal entity or has committed any improper conduct in relation to such system; and
 - cancel a contract awarded to a person if the person committed any corrupt or fraudulent act during the bidding process or the execution of the contract.
- This MBD serves as a certificate of declaration that would be used by institutions to ensure that, when bids are considered, reasonable steps are taken to prevent any form of bid-rigging.
- In order to give effect to the above, the attached Certificate of Bid Determination (MBD 9) must be completed and submitted with the bid:

¹ Includes price quotations, advertised competitive bids, limited bids and proposals.

² Bid rigging (or collusive bidding) occurs when businesses, that would otherwise be expected to compete, secretly conspire to raise prices or lower the quality of goods and / or services for purchasers who wish to acquire goods and / or services through a bidding process. Bid rigging is, therefore, an agreement between competitors not to compete.

CERTIFICATE OF INDEPENDENT BID DETERMINATION

I, the undersigned, in submitting the accompanying bid:		
(Bid Number and Description)		
in response to the invitation for the bid made by:		
(Name of Municipality / Municipal Entity)		
do hereby make the following statements that I certify to be true and complete in every respect:		
I certify, on behalf of:that:		
(Name of Bidder)		

- I have read and I understand the contents of this Certificate;
- 2. I understand that the accompanying bid will be disqualified if this Certificate is found not to be true and complete in every respect;
- 3. I am authorized by the bidder to sign this Certificate, and to submit the accompanying bid, on behalf of the bidder;
- Each person whose signature appears on the accompanying bid has been authorized by the bidder to determine the terms of, and to sign, the bid, on behalf of the bidder;
- 5. For the purposes of this Certificate and the accompanying bid, I understand that the word "competitor" shall include any individual or organization, other than the bidder, whether or not affiliated with the bidder, who:

- (a) has been requested to submit a bid in response to this bid invitation:
 - (b) could potentially submit a bid in response to this bid invitation, based on their qualifications, abilities or experience; and
 - (c) provides the same goods and services as the bidder and/or is in the same line of business as the bidder

MBD 9

- 6. The bidder has arrived at the accompanying bid independently from, and without consultation, communication, agreement or arrangement with any competitor. However, communication between partners in a joint venture or consortium³ will not be construed as collusive bidding.
- 7. In particular, without limiting the generality of paragraphs 6 above, there has been no consultation, communication, agreement or arrangement with any competitor regarding:
 - (a) prices;
 - (b) geographical area where product or service will be rendered (market allocation)
 - (c) methods, factors or formulas used to calculate prices;
 - (d) the intention or decision to submit or not to submit, a bid;
 - (e) the submission of a bid which does not meet the specifications and conditions of the bid; or
 - (f) bidding with the intention not to win the bid.
- 8. In addition, there have been no consultations, communications, agreements or arrangements with any competitor regarding the quality, quantity, specifications and conditions or delivery particulars of the products or services to which this bid invitation relates.
- 9. The terms of the accompanying bid have not been, and will not be, disclosed by the bidder, directly or indirectly, to any competitor, prior to the date and time of the official bid opening or of the awarding of the contract.

³ Joint venture or Consortium means an association of persons for the purpose of combining their expertise, property, capital, efforts, skill and knowledge in an activity for the execution of a contract.

10. I am aware that, in addition and without prejudice to any other remedy provided to combat any restrictive practices related to bids and contracts, bids that are suspicious will be reported to the Competition Commission for investigation and possible imposition of administrative penalties in terms of section 59 of the Competition Act No 89 of 1998 and or may be reported to the National Prosecuting Authority (NPA) for criminal investigation and or may be restricted from conducting business with the public sector for a period not exceeding ten (10) years in terms of the Prevention and Combating of Corrupt Activities Act No 12 of 2004 or any other applicable legislation.

Signature	Date
Position	Name of Bidder